
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

WITHDREW

Opened: October 27, 2021 Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Mail Screening Equipment Atlantic Diving Supply, Inc Barbara Technologies 

Corporation

RaySecur, Inc.

6100014252 JS

Item Description Quantity

1 Raysecur 300 Mail Screening Equipment

Price each year 1 $67,201.84 $67,110.00 $72,888.45

Total price $67,201.84 $67,110.00 $72,888.45

2 Year 1 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 

software updates, calibration, and operator certification

Price each year 1 $5,801.32 $5,794.00 $5,863.98

Total price $5,801.32 $5,794.00 $5,863.98

3 Year 2 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 

software updates, calibration, and operator certification
Price each year 1 $5,801.32 $5,794.00 NO BID

Total price $5,801.32 $5,794.00

4 Year 3 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 

software updates, calibration, and operator certification
Price each year 1 $5,801.32 $5,794.00 NO BID

Total price $5,801.32 $5,794.00

5 Year 4 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 

software updates, calibration, and operator certification
Price each year 1 $5,801.32 $5,794.00 NO BID

Total price $5,801.32 $5,794.00

6 Year 5 - Annual Service Package includes maintenance, 

software updates, calibration, and operator certification
Price each year 1 $5,801.32 $5,794.00 NO BID

Total price $5,801.32 $5,794.00

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Total $96,208.44 $96,080.00 $78,752.43

Total Award $96,208.44 Incomplete

621 Lynnhaven Pkwy

Virginia Beach, VA 23452

757-416-7526

3800 NW Loop 410, Suite 105

San Antonio, TX 78229

356 University Drive 

Westwood, MA 02090
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